
 
            

BETW
 

A PRO

 Fia
lan
 

 Th
eve
 

 Th
for
ass

 
Turin, 26 
cooperatio
advantag
and after
 
The agree
Chrysler G
the Marke
 
Both grou
be held in
partnershi
fleet of ca
courtesy c
project fe
attention d
to the exh
Group and
 
The imme
in the mo
and busin

WEEN TH

OGRAMM

at-Chrysle
nce profe

he agreem
ent in wh

he develo
r long-ter
sistance 

September
on to off

geous term
 sale assist

ement was 
Group and 
eting Depar

ups are Off
n Milan fr
ip came in
ars to be u
cars for th
eaturing s
devoted to 
hibition wi
d through t

ediate obje
obility sect
nesses. In f

CO
HE FIAT-

ME OF SP
P

er and I
essionals 

ment aris
hich both 

pment of
rm vehic

r 2014 – F
fer the cu

ms for long
tance. 

signed by
Stefano B

rtment of t

ficial Glob
rom 1 May
nto being a
used for m
he guest d
everal init
the Smart 

ill be on sa
the Interne

ctive is to 
tor, the cos
fact, Italian

PRE

OMMERC
-CHRYSL

PECIAL T
PURCHA

ntesa Sa
and sma

ses in the
groups a

f a comm
le rental,

Fiat-Chrysl
ustomers 
g-term ren

y Alfredo 
Barrese, H
the Intesa S

al Partner
y to 31 Oc
nd was de

moving aro
delegations
tiatives fo
City, Food

ale at the b
t Banking

provide sp
st of which
ns are askin

SS RELE
 
 

CIAL AG
LER GRO

TERMS F
ASE OF V

 
anpaolo j
all busine

e context
are Officia

mercial pla
, purchas

ler and In
of the B
ntal, purc

Altavilla, 
Head of the 
Sanpaolo G

rs of Expo
ctober nex

eveloped. I
ound inside
s. Intesa S
or supplier
d and Tour
branches o
service.  

pecial term
h is a majo
ng compan

EASE 

GREEMEN
OUP AND

FOR LON
VEHICLE

join forc
esses in th

t of prep
al Global

an is envi
se of new

tesa Sanp
Banks of 
chase of c

COO of t
Planning a

Group. 

o Milano 2
xt year, an
n particula
e the area 

Sanpaolo h
rs, sponso
rism sector
of the Grou

ms for ind
or expense 
nies and ba

NT 
D INTESA

NG-TERM
S 

es to he
he mobili

aration fo
Partners

isaged w
w vehicle

aolo have 
the Intes

ars and c

the EMEA
and Contro

015, the un
d it is in 

ar, Fiat-Chr
of Expo M

has develop
ors and vi
rs. Moreov
up Banks, 

ividuals a
item in the
anks to dev

A SANPA

M RENTA

elp famili
ity sector

or Expo 
s 

with speci
es and af

initiated c
sa Sanpao
commercia

A Region o
ol Departm

niversal ex
this contex

hrysler will
Milano 20

oped a wid
isitors, wi
ver, admiss

at the AT

and small b
e budgets o
velop new

AOLO 

AL AND 

ies, free-
r 

2015, an

fic offers
fter sales

ommercial
olo Group
al vehicles

of the Fiat-
ment and of

xhibition to
xt that the
l provide a
015 and as
de ranging
ith special
sion tickets
TMs of the

businesses
of families

w products

 

-

n 

s 
s 

l 
p 
s 

-
f 

o 
e 
a 
s 
g 
l 
s 
e 

s 
s 
s 



and services which are nearer to their needs and which allow them a simpler life without 
spending more. 
Furthermore, the cooperation between Fiat-Chrysler and Intesa Sanpaolo, two leaders in the 
world of business and banking, responds to the need for concrete action to stimulate a 
recovery in consumption.1  
 
Starting in October, the agreement will enable customers of the Banks of the Group to rent a 
vehicle over a long term – which is what happens for example with company fleets – 
obtaining the service at advantageous rates which can be seen directly on line. This 
formula, as we all know, transforms the utilisation cost of the vehicle into an “all-inclusive” 
monthly instalment with a saving on registration fees, road tax, ownership tax, insurance, 
maintenance and contingencies.  
 
Other aspects of the agreement will be determined by Intesa Sanpaolo e Fiat-Chrysler 
concerning joint offers for the purchase of new vehicles and special terms for after sales 
assistance. 
 
For Alfredo Altavilla the agreement with Intesa Sanpaolo “brings together two 
organisations which are very important in the country’s economy, since they are adopting a 
coordinated approach and provide services to anyone to improve their daily mobility, as we 
have already done with car sharing. Our group produces cars which are increasingly 
focused on environmental matters, comfort and advanced technology, but it is important for 
the entire automotive industry to adapt to the expectations of every motorist. And today’s 
agreement moves in this direction”. 
 
Stefano Barrese pointed out that the agreement with Fiat-Chrysler “makes it possible to 
strengthen the offer in a sector which affects the budgets of families and small to medium 
businesses considerably. For some time Intesa Sanpaolo has initiated a structured change 
with the goal of becoming a reference point for 11.5 million customers not only with regard 
to banking and investment operations, but also for equally important needs, such as 
insurance coverage, purchases and payments. Furthermore, the Bank has extended the 
possibility of receiving customers outside working hours and on Saturday mornings, and to 
access products, services and advice on line”. 
 
 
 
 
For information: 
  
Intesa Sanpaolo        Fiat-Chrysler 
Press Relations - Banca of the Territory and Local Media   Communications Region EMEA 
Tel. +39 011 5556652       Tel. +39 011 0038901 
stampa@intesasanpaolo.com                                                             pressoffice@fiat.com 
   

                                                            
1 According to a research by GfK Eurisko for Intesa Sanpaolo on Consumers’ Behaviours, 
updated to August 2014, the perception of consumers is now less critical; compared to the 
beginning of the year, 6 million more Italians express more positive opinions on their 
economic condition. Nevertheless, Italian families continue to spend very cautiously: the 
strategy of containing expenditure is still the first priority for 43% of consumers.  


